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To:

Subject:
Date:
Attachments:

Felipe,
Seeking clarity about the cost of this repair. In one email you sent the invoice for $137.50 and
then sent a separate email indicating that the cost was $353. Which is it?

Sent from my iPhone

Begin forwarded message:

From: Felipe <felipe@execvillas.com>
Date: December 28,2020 at 1:41:46 PM EST

To: Marilyn Mosby <marilynmosby@hotmail.com>
Cc: Andy <andy@execvillas.com>
Subject: Estimate from My Pool Repairs LLC

Hi Marilyn,

i hope that you are fine and had a great Christmas!

Attached an estimate that we received for your approval.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Felipe Jorge
Executive Villas Florida

www.executivevillasflorida.com

Email: feliDe@execvillas.com
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